TOWN OF SUPERIOR
RESOLUTION NO. R-27
SERIES 2017

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF
SUPERIOR APPROVING A CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT WITH H2
ENTERPRISES, LLC FOR TRACT H CONSTRUCTION

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF
SUPERIOR, COLORADO, as follows:

Section 1. The Construction Contract between the Town
of Superior and H2 Enterprises, LLC for Tract H Construction is
hereby approved in substantially the same form as attached
hereto, subject to final approval by the Town Attorney.

ADOPTED this 22"% day of May, 2017.

it Sotos.

Clint Folsom, Mayor

by

o [
ZCaspp08 [

in, Town Clerk-Treasurer

oA

1
51222017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 201 \MAY 22, 201 NITEM #12D - 2RESOLUTION TRACT H CONSTRUCTION.DOC



CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT

THIS CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT (the "Contract") is made and entered into this QANA
day of May, 2017 (the "Effective Date"), by and between the Town of Superior, a Colorado
municipal corporation with an address of 124 East Coal Creek Drive, Superior, Colorado 80027 (the
"Town"), and H2 Enterprises, LLC, an independent contractor with a principal place of business at
4626 County Road 65, Keenesburg, Colorado 80643 ("Contractor") (each individually a "Party" and
collectively the "Parties").

For the consideration hereinafter set forth, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby
acknowledged, the Parties agree as follows:

1 Scope of Work. Contractor shall perform the following described work (the "Work"), in
accordance with this Contract and the Contract Documents, attached hereto and incorporated herein
by this reference: All services, materials and labor to construct Tract H landscape in a 15.7-acre
area that separates Downtown Superior and the northwest area of the Rock Creek neighborhood.

2. Bonds. Within 10 days of the date of this Contract, Contractor shall provide the payment
and performance bond and certificate of insurance required by the Contract Documents.

3 Commencement and Completion of Work. Contractor shall commence the Work within 10
days of date of the Notice to Proceed. Substantial Completion of the Work shall be accomplished
by August 1, 2017, unless the period for completion is extended otherwise in accordance with the
Contract Documents. Final Completion of the Work shall be accomplished within 30 days of the
date of Substantial Completion.

4. Compensation/Contract Price. The Town agrees to pay Contractor, subject to all of the
terms and conditions of the Contract Documents, an amount not to exceed $485,857.63. The Town
shall pay Contractor in the manner and at such times as set forth in the General Provisions.

5. Illegal Aliens.

A. Certification. By entering into this Contract, Contractor hereby certifies that, at the
time of this certification, it does not knowingly employ or contract with an illegal alien who will
perform work under this Contract and that Contractor will participate in either the E-Verify Program
administered by the United States Department of Homeland Security and Social Security
Administration or the Department Program administered by the Colorado Department of Labor and
Employment in order to confirm the employment eligibility of all employees who are newly hired
for employment to perform work under this Contract.

B. Prohibited Acts. Contractor shall not knowingly employ or contract with an illegal
alien to perform work under this Contract or enter into a contract with a subcontractor that fails to
certify to Contractor that the subcontractor shall not knowingly employ or contract with an illegal
alien to perform work under this Contract.

1
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 201 7\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617.DOCX



C. Verification.

1. If Contractor has employees, Contractor has confirmed or attempted to confirm the
employment eligibility of all employees who are newly hired for employment to perform
work under this Contract through participation in either the E-Verify Program or the
Department Program.

2 Contractor shall not use the E-Verify or Department Program procedures to
undertake pre-employment screening of job applicants while this Contract is being
performed.

3 If Contractor obtains actual knowledge that a subcontractor performing work under
this Contract knowingly employs or contracts with an illegal alien who is performing work
under this Contract, Contractor shall: notify the subcontractor and the Town within 3 days
that Contractor has actual knowledge that the subcontractor is employing or contracting with
an illegal alien who is performing work under this Contract; and terminate the subcontract
with the subcontractor if within 3 days of receiving the notice required pursuant to
subsection a hereof, the subcontractor does not stop employing or contracting with the
illegal alien who is performing work under this Contract; except that Contractor shall not
terminate the contract with the subcontractor if during such 3 days the subcontractor
provides information to establish that the subcontractor has not knowingly employed or
contracted with an illegal alien who is performing work under this Contract.

D. Duty to Comply with Investigations. Contractor shall comply with any reasonable
request by the Colorado Department of Labor and Employment made in the course of an
investigation conducted pursuant to C.R.S. § 8-17.5-102(5)(a) to ensure that Contractor is
complying with the terms of this Contract.

E. Affidavits. If Contractor does not have employees, Contractor shall sign the
attached "No Employee Affidavit." If Contractor wishes to verify the lawful presence of newly
hired employees who perform work under the Contract via the Department Program, Contractor
shall sign the "Department Program Affidavit" attached hereto.

6. Keep Jobs In Colorado Act. Pursuant to the Keep Jobs in Colorado Act, C.R.S. § 8-17-101,
et seq. (the "Act"), and the rules adopted by the Division of Labor of the Colorado Department of
Labor and Employment implementing the Act (the "Rules"), Contractor shall employ Colorado
labor to perform at least 80% of the work under this Contract and shall obtain and maintain the
records required by the Act and the Rules. For purposes of this Section, "Colorado labor" means a
person who is a resident of the state of Colorado at the time of this Contract, without discrimination
as to race, color, creed, sex, sexual orientation, marital status, national origin, ancestry, age, or
religion except when sex or age is a bona fide qualification. A resident of the state of Colorado is a
person with a valid Colorado driver's license, a valid Colorado state-issued photo identification, or
documentation that he or she has resided in Colorado for the last 30 days. Contractor represents that
it is familiar with the requirements of the Act and the Rules and will fully comply with same. This
Section shall not apply to any project for which appropriation or expenditure of moneys may be
reasonably expected not to exceed $500,000 in the aggregate for any fiscal year.

2
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 201 7\MAY 22, 2017UTEM #12D - 3SCONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



7. Governing Law and Venue. This Contract shall be governed by the laws of the State of
Colorado, and any legal action concerning the provisions hereof shall be brought in Boulder
County, Colorado.

8. No Waiver. Delays in enforcement or the waiver of any one or more defaults or breaches of
this Contract by the Town shall not constitute a waiver of any of the other terms or obligation of this
Contract.

9. Integration. This Contract and any attached exhibits constitute the entire Contract between
Contractor and the Town, superseding all prior oral or written communications.

10.  Third Parties. There are no intended third-party beneficiaries to this Contract.

11.  Notice. Any notice under this Contract shall be in writing, and shall be deemed sufficient
when directly presented or sent pre-paid, first class U.S. Mail to the Party at the address set forth
on the first page of this Contract.

12.  Severability. If any provision of this Contract is found by a court of competent
jurisdiction to be unlawful or unenforceable for any reason, the remaining provisions hereof shall
remain in full force and effect.

13.  Modification. This Contract may only be modified upon written agreement of the
Parties.

14.  Assignment. Neither this Contract nor any of the rights or obligations of the Parties shall be
assigned by either party without the written consent of the other.

15.  Governmental Immunity. The Town and its officers, attorneys and employees are relying
on, and do not waive or intend to waive by any provision of this Contract, the monetary limitations
or any other rights, immunities, and protections provided by the Colorado Governmental Immunity
Act, CR.S. § 24-10-101, et seq., as amended, or otherwise available to the Town and its officers,
attorneys or employees.

16.  Rights and Remedies. The rights and remedies of the Town under this Contract are in
addition to any other rights and remedies provided by law. The expiration of this Contract shall in
no way limit the Town's legal or equitable remedies, or the period in which such remedies may be
asserted, for work negligently or defectively performed.

17.  Subject to Annual Appropriation. Consistent with Article X, § 20 of the Colorado
Constitution, any financial obligation of the Town not performed during the current fiscal year is
subject to annual appropriation, shall extend only to monies currently appropriated, and shall not
constitute a mandatory charge, requirement or liability beyond the current fiscal year.

3
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 201 7\MAY 22, 201 7\ITEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617. DOCX



IN WITNESS WHEREQF, this Construction Contract has been executed by the Parties as
of the Effective Date.

TOWN OF SUPERIOR, COLORADO

Clint Folsom, Mayor

o
By: VARY N _
STATE OF COLORADO )
COUNTY OF _Polamz ;SS.

The foregoing instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me this (iﬂz

day of [\_AQ# , 2017, by Pvian Milvuev as 'Pk%'ggt Mg;ggfﬂﬂ_r of
H'} Eﬂtzw'ggs . '

My commission expires: [ ’ A5 19“01 9

(REAL) W&PMLM@L
MELISSA K. SPORNEY Notary Public

NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE OF COLORADO

NOTARY ID 20034024734
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES JULY 25, 2019

4
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



NO EMPLOYEE AFFIDAVIT
[To be completed only if Contractor has no employees]
1. Check and complete one:

] L , am a sole proprietor doing business as
. I do not currently employ any individuals. Should I employ any
employees during the term of my Contract with the Town of Superior (the "Town"), I certify that I
will comply with the lawful presence verification requirements outlined in that Contract.

OR

] I, , am the sole owner/member/shareholder of

,a [specify type of entity —
i.e., corporation, limited liability company], that does not currently employ any individuals. Should
I employ any individuals during the term of my Contract with the Town, I certify that I will comply
with the lawful presence verification requirements outlined in that Contract.

2. Check one.

] I am a United States citizen or legal permanent resident.

The Town must verify this statement by reviewing one of the following items:
» A valid Colorado driver's license or a Colorado identification card,

A United States military card or a military dependent's identification card;

A United States Coast Guard Merchant Mariner card;

A Native American tribal document;

In the case of a resident of another state, the driver’s license or state-issued

identification card from the state of residence, if that state requires the applicant to

prove lawful presence prior to the issuance of the identification card; or

»  Any other documents or combination of documents listed in the Town's “Acceptable
Documents for Lawful Presence Verification” chart that prove both Contractor’s
citizenship/lawful presence and identity.

OR
] I am otherwise lawfully present in the United States pursuant to federal law.

Contractor must verify this statement through the federal Systematic Alien Verification of
Entitlement ("SAVE”) program, and provide such verification to the Town.

Signature Date

5
3162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7\ITEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



DEPARTMENT PROGRAM AFFIDAVIT

[To be completed only if Contractor participates in the
P/ Department of Labor Lawful Presence Verification Program]

g -
L _) / b, /\)’(L}\IVD:%, LLC, as a public contractor under contract with the Town of
Superior (the "Town"), hereby affirm that:

1. I have examined or will examine the legal work status of all employees who are
newly hired for employment to perform work under this public contract for services (the
"Contract") with the Town within 20 days e}fter such hiring date;

2. I have retained or will retain file copies of all documents required by 8 U.S.C. §
1324a which verify the employment eligibility and identity of newly hired employees who perform
work under the Contract; and

I have not and will not alter or falsify the identification documents for my newly
g¢s who perform work under the Contract.

STATE OF COLORADO )
) ss.
COUNTY OF __ Pdame )

The foregoing instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me this ﬁﬁ

day of :ﬁglﬁié , 2017, by _Bijan Milnstr  as E@M%grof
- V L = . *

My commission expires: | l AS ' roIq

C -\,
NOTARY PUBLIC Notary Public

STATE OF COLORADO
NOTARY ID 20034024734
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES JuLy 25, 2018

6
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDINN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

STATE OF )
) ss.
COUNTY OF )
I , being first duly sworn, state and affirm, under penalty of law, that I

am familiar with the insurance coverages maintained by the Insured,
and the coverage requirements set forth in the foregoing Certificate of Insurance, that I have
completed or caused to be completed and subsequently reviewed the foregoing Certificate of
Insurance and that the information provided contained therein is true and correct to the best of
my knowledge. I further understand that the Town of Superior shall rely on the information
provided.

This information is provided for the Town of Superior, Work No.

By:
Title:
Agency:
STATE OF COLORADO )
) ss.
COUNTY OF )

‘The foregoing instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me this
day of , 2017, by , as
of

My commission expires:

(SEAL)

Notary Public

7
5162017
P:ASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7\UTEM #12D - 3SCONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



NOTICE OF AWARD

Date:

Contractor Name

Address

RE: Tract H Open Space Landscape

Dear H2 Enterprises, LLC:

Thank you for submitting a Bid for the Tract H Open Space Landscape.

Your firm submitted the most qualified Bid and you have been selected as the successful
Contractor. Accordingly, this is your Notice of Award for the Tract H Open Space Landscape.

Enclosed please find an original and duplicate original Construction Contract. Please review and
sign both, then, within 10 days of receipt of this letter, return both to me along with your
certification of insurance, payment and performance bond, each in the full amount of the Contract
Price, and appropriate powers of attorney. When dating the above documents, please make sure that
all dates, on all documents, are the same and that the insurance policy reflects the requirements of
the Contract Documents. Please return all of the documents at the same time, in the same envelope.

Upon receipt of the signed Contracts, the Town will execute both and return one fully executed
original to you.

Should you have any questions, please call me at (303) 499-3675
Sincerely,

Project Manager

8
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



NOTICE TO PROCEED

Date:

Contractor Name

Address

Dear

This letter is your Notice to Proceed, effective as of the date cited below. This notice is in reference
to the Construction Contract between you and the Town of Superior concerning the

Please note that in accordance with the Construction Contract, Work must commence within ten
days of the date of this Notice, and all Work must be substantially completed within

( ) days of the date of this Notice, which shall be the  day of
, 20__, and finally completed within days of the date of this
Notice, which shall be the  day of ,20 .

If you have any questions, please call me at

Sincerely,

, Project Manager

Date

9
516:2017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



BID BOND

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS

THAT , as PRINCIPAL, and

as SURETY, are held and firmly bound unto the Town of Superior, Colorado, hereinafter called
OWNER, as Obligee, in the penal sum of dollars
(3 ), for the payment of which sum in lawful money of the United States, well

and truly to be made, said PRINCIPAL and SURETY bind themselves, their heirs, executors,
administrators, successors and assigns, jointly and severally, firmly by these presents.

WHEREAS, the PRINCIPAL has subinitted a Bid fo OWNER for certain Work or services
generally described as follows:

NOW, THEREFORE, (a) if said Bid shall be rejected, or (b) if said Bid shall be accepted and the
PRINCIPAL is awarded the Contract and, within the time and manner specified in the Contract
Documents, enters into a written Contract in the prescribed form and shall give such bond or
bonds as may be specified in the Contract Documents to guarantee faithful performance of such
Contract and to guarantee prompt payment of labor and materials furnished in the prosecution
thereof, and shall provide to OWNER a Certificate of Insurance as required by the Contract
Documents, and shall in all other respects perform the Contract created by the acceptance of said
Bid, or (c) in the event of the failure of the PRINCIPAL to enter such Contract and to give such
bond or bonds, and Certificate of Insurance, if the PRINCIPAL shall pay to OWNER the
difference not to exceed the penalty hereof between the amount specified in said Bid and such
larger amount for which the OWNER may in good faith contract with another party to perform
the Work covered by said Bid, then this obligation shall be null and void, otherwise it shall be
and remain in full force and effect.

The SURETY, for value received, hereby stipulates and agrees that the obligations of said
SURETY hereunder shall be in no way impaired or affected by any alteration or irregularities in
the bid or in the bidding procedure or by any extension of time within which OWNER may
accept such Bid, and does hereby waive notice of same.

Dated this day of ,20_
(SURETY) (PRINCIPAL)

By: By:

Title: Title:

(ACKNOWLEDGMENTS AND POWER OF ATTORNEY TO BE ATTACHED)
CORPORATE SEAL MUST BE AFFIXED IF PRINCIPAL IS A CORPORATION.

10
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 2017UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617.DOCX



PAYMENT AND PERFORMANCE BOND

Bond No.

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: that
(Firm)

(Address)
(an Individual), (a Partnership), (a Corporation), hereinafter referred to as "the Principal", and

(Firm)
(Address)

hereinafter referred to as "the Surety", are held and firmly bound unto the Town of Superior,
Colorado, a Municipal Corporation, hereinafter referred to as "the Owner", in the penal sum of
Dollars in lawful money of the United States, for the payment of
which sum well and truly to be made, we bind ourselves, successors and assigns, jointly and
severally, firmly by these presents.

THE CONDITIONS OF THIS OBLIGATION are such that whereas the Principal entered into a
certain Contract with the Owner, dated the day of ,20 , a copy
of which is hereto attached and made a part hereof for the performance of the Work,

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Principal shall well, truly and faithfully perform its duties, all the
undertakings, covenants, terms, conditions and agreements of said Contract during the original term
thereof, and any extensions thereof which may be granted by the Owner, with or without Notice to
the Surety and during the life of the guaranty or warranty period, and shall satisfy all claims and
demands incurred under such Contract, and shall fully indemnify and save harmless the Owner from
all cost and damages which it may suffer by the Principal's failure to do so, and shall reimburse and
repay the Owner all outlay and expense which the Owner may incur in making good any default,
and make payment to all persons, firms, subcontractors and corporations furnishing materials for or
performing labor in the prosecution of the work provided for in such Contract, and any authorized
extension or modification thereof, including all amounts due for materials, lubricants, repairs on
machinery, equipment and tools, consumed, rented or used in connection with the construction of
such work, and all insurance premiums on said work, and for all labor performed in such work,
whether by subcontractor or otherwise, then this obligation shall be void; otherwise it shall remain
in full force and effect.

PROVIDED, FURTHER, that the said Surety, for value received, hereby stipulates and agrees that
no change, extension of time, alteration or addition to the terms of the Contract or to the Work to be
performed thereunder or the specifications accompanying the same shall in any way affect its
obligation on this Bond; and it does hereby waive notice of any such change, extension of time,
alteration or addition to the terms of the Contract or to the Work or to the Specifications.

PROVIDED, FURTHER, that no final settlement between the Owner and the Principal shall
abridge the right of any beneficiary hereunder whose claim may be unsatisfied.

11
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 2017\UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617.DOCX



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this instrument is executed in 5 counterparts, each one of which shall be

deemed an original, this day of , 20
ATTEST: PRINCIPAL
By: By:
Title: Title:
Address:
(Corporate Seal)
SURETY
ATTEST: Surety:
By: By:
Attorney-in-Fact: Title:
Address:
(Surety Seal)
NOTE: Date of Bond must not be prior to date of Contract and Surety must be authorized to

transact business in the State of Colorado and be acceptable to the Town.

12
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDINWPDOCS\WMEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7TEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



CERTIFICATE OF FINAL PAYMENT

With reference to Contract Number dated s 20,
between the undersigned Contractor and the Town of Superior, for:
at Superior, Colorado

The undersigned hereby certifies that all costs, charges and expenses incurred by it on its behalf
for work, labor, services, materials and equipment supplied to the foregoing premises, and/or
used in connection with its Work under the Contract have been duly paid.

The undersigned further certifies that to its best knowledge and belief (based upon reasonable
investigation) each of its subcontractors and material men have duly paid all costs, charges and
expenses incurred by them or on their behalf for work, labor, services, materials and equipment
supplied to the foregoing premises and/or used by them in connection with the Undersigned’s
Work under the Contract.

In consideration of dollars ($ ) representing final payment under
the Contract, the undersigned hereby releases and discharges the Owner and Owner's property
from all claims, liens and obligations of every nature arising out of or in connection with the
performance of the Work.

As additional consideration for the final payment, and to the fullest extent permitted by law, the
undersigned agrees to indemnify and hold harmless Owner from and against all costs, losses,
damages, claims, causes of action, judgments and expenses arising out of or in connection with
claims against Owner which may be asserted by the undersigned or any suppliers, subcontractors
of any tier or any of their representatives, officers, agents and employees for the costs, losses,
damages, claims, causes of action, judgments and expenses and expenses that are attributable to
the act, omission, error, professional error, mistake, negligence or other fault of the undersigned.

The foregoing shall not relieve the Undersigned of its obligations under the provisions of the
Contract as amended, which by their nature survive completion of the Work including, without

limitation, warranties, guarantees and indemnities.

Executed this day of ,20__

Contractor

13
5/16/2017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 201 7\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3SCONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617.DOCX



CERTIFICATE OF FINAL ACCEPTANCE

Date:
TO: Project No.:
Project Title:

This is to advise you that a final inspection of the referenced Work has been made and all
work and material was found to be satisfactory. Therefore, the Work is considered to be
complete in accordance with the approved plans, specifications and contract documents.

In accordance with the Contract, all Warranty periods shall begin as of the date of this
letter.

TOWN OF SUPERIOR

By:
Title:

14
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617.DOCX



GENERAL PROVISIONS

PART 1. DEFINITIONS
1.01 CONTRACT DOCUMENTS:

Bid Form (Including Bid Summary);
Bid Schedule;

Bidder's Qualification Statement;
Construction Contract;

General Provisions

Special Provisions; _

Technical Specifications;
Construction Drawings;

Certificate of Insurance Verification;
Notice of Award;

Notice to Proceed;

Bid Bond;

Payment and Performance Bond,
Certificate of Final Payment;

Final Acceptance Form; and
Documentation submitted by Contractor prior to Notice of Award.

NOZEZrANCIEIOMEUOWE

1.02 CHANGE ORDER:

A written order issued by the Town after execution of the Contract authorizing an addition, deletion
or revision in the Work, or an adjustment in the Contract Price or the Contract Time.

1.03 TOWN:
The Town of Superior, Colorado.
1.04 CONTRACT:

The entire written agreement covering the performance of the Work described in the Contract
Documents including all supplemental agreements thereto and all general and special provisions
pertaining to the Work and materials therefor.

1.05 CONTRACT PRICE:

The amount set forth in Paragraph 4 of the Construction Contract.

1.06 CONTRACT TIME:

The time for completion of the Work as set forth in Paragraph 3 of the Construction Contract.
1.07 DAY:

Calendar day, unless otherwise specified. When the last day for the occurrence of an event falls on
a Sunday or legal holiday as recognized by the Town, the time for performance shall be
automatically extended to the next business day.

15
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017 MAY 22, 2017\TEM #12D - 3SCONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



1.08 FINAL COMPLETION:

The date as certified by the Project Manager when all of the Work is completed and final payment
may be made.

1.09 PROJECT MANAGER:
The Town's duly authorized representative in connection with the Work.
1.10 SUBCONTRACTOR:

Any person, firm or corporation with a direct contract with Contractor who acts for or in behalf of
Contractor in executing any part of the Contract, excluding one who merely furnishes material.

1.11 SUBSTANTIAL COMPLETION:

The date as certified by the Project Manager when the Town occupies or takes possession of all or
substantially all of the Work, or when the Town may occupy or take possession of all or
substantially all of the Work and put it to beneficial use for its intended purposes.

1.12 WORK:

All the work specified, indicated, shown or contemplated in the Contract Documents, including all
alterations, amendments or extensions thereto made by supplemental agreements or written orders
of the Project Manager.

PART 2. TIME

2.01 TIME OF THE ESSENCE:

All times stated in the Contract Documents are of the essence.

2.02 FINAL ACCEPTANCE:

Upon Final Completion, the Project Manager will issue final acceptance.
2.03 CHANGES IN THE WORK:

The Town reserves the right to order changes in the Work, in the nature of additions, deletions or
modifications, without invalidating the Contract, and to make corresponding adjustments in the
Contract Price and the Contract Time. All changes shall be authorized by a written Change Order
signed by the Project Manager. The Change Order shall include appropriate changes in the Contract
Documents and the Contract Time. The Work shall be changed and the Contract Price and Contract
Time modified only as set forth in the written Change Order. Any adjustment in the Contract Price
resulting in a credit or a charge to the Town shall be determined by mutual agreement of the parties
before the work set forth in the Change Order is commenced. If a Change Order results in an
increase in the Contract Price, approval of the Superior Board of Trustees shall be required, and if
such approval is not obtained, the Town shall have no payment obligation regardless of whether the
Work pursuant to the Change Order has been performed.

2.04 DELAYS:

A. If Contractor is delayed in the progress of the Work by fire, unusual delay in
transportation, unanticipated adverse weather conditions, or other unavoidable casualties
beyond Contractor's control other than unanticipated adverse weather conditions, the
Contract Time shall be extended for a reasonable period of time. "Weather" means
precipitation, temperature, or wind, and an "adverse weather condition" means weather that

16
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 201 7\MAY 22, 201 UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



on any calendar day varies from the average weather conditions for that day by more than
100% as measured by the National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration. The term
"unanticipated adverse weather conditions” means the number of days in excess of the
anticipated adverse weather days per month as set forth below:

MONTHLY ANTICIPATED ADVERSE WEATHER DAYS
JAN FEB MAR APR MAY JUN JUL AUG SEP OCT NOV DEC
7 4 4 4 6 3 4 2 3 3 2 5

By reason of example only, if in March there are two days when the snowfall exceeds the
average snowfall for that day by 100%, those two days will have experienced an adverse
weather condition. However, there will have been no unanticipated adverse weather
condition in March, because there are four anticipated adverse weather days in March,
which should be accounted for in the schedule. If, however, there are five days in which the
snowfall exceeds the average snowfall by 100%, an unanticipated adverse weather condition
will have occurred, and Contractor shall be entitled to request an extension of time.

B. Any request for extension of the Contract Time shall be made in writing to the
Project Manager not more than 7 days after commencement of the delay; otherwise it shall
be waived. Any such request shall contain an estimate of the probable effect of such delay
on the progress of the Work.

C. Contractor shall not be entitled to any increase in the Contract Price, or to damages,
or to additional compensation as a consequence of any such delays.

2.05 NODAMAGESFORDELAY:

In strict accordance with C.R.S. § 24-91-103.5, the Town shall not amend the Contract Price to
provide for additional compensation for any delays in performance which are not the result of acts
or omissions of the Town or persons acting on behalf of the Town.

PART 3. CONTRACTOR'S RESPONSIBILITIES
3.01 COMPLETION/SUPERVISION OF WORK:

Contractor hereby warrants that it is qualified to assume the responsibilities and render the services
described herein and has all requisite corporate authority and licenses in good standing. The
services performed by Contractor shall be in accordance with generally accepted professional
practices and the level of competency presently maintained by others in the same or similar type of
work, and in compliance with applicable laws, ordinances, rules and regulations. Contractor shall
be responsible for completion of all Work in a timely and workmanlike manner in accordance with
the terms and specifications of the Contract Documents, including the techniques, sequences,
procedures and means. Contractor shall be responsible for the coordination of all Work. Contractor
shall supervise and direct the Work and give it all attention necessary for proper supervision and
direction. Contractor shall maintain a supervisor on site at all times when Contractor or any
subcontractor is performing Work.

3.02 DUTY TO INSPECT:

Contractor shall inspect all Contract Documents, tests and reports, including soil tests and
engineering tests, if applicable, and shall conduct a site or field review prior to executing the

17
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



Contract. Contractor assumes the risk of all conditions which are disclosed, or which are reasonably
suggested by any such tests or reports, or which would be disclosed by a field or site review.
Contractor shall have the affirmative duty to advise the Town of any concemns which Contractor
may have regarding construction conditions prior to executing the Contract.

3.03

3.04

3.05

FURNISHING OF LABOR AND MATERIALS:

A. Contractor shall provide and pay for all labor, materials and equipment, including:
tools; construction equipment and machinery; utilities, including water; transportation; and
all other facilities and services necessary for the proper completion of the Work.

B. In all purchases of supplies, materials and provisions to be incorporated or otherwise

“used by Contractor in the Work, Contractor shall usesupplies, materials and provisions

produced, manufactured or grown in Colorado if such supplies, materials and provisions are
not of inferior quality to those offered by competitors outside of Colorado.

C. While engaged in the performance of the Work, Contractor shall maintain
employment practices that do not violate the provisions of the Colorado Antidiscrimination
Actof 1957, C.R.S. § 24-34-301, et seq.

EMPLOYEES AND SAFETY:

A. Contractor shall maintain at all times strict discipline of its employees, and
Contractor shall not employ on the Work any person unfit or without sufficient knowledge,
skill, and experience to perform properly the job for which the employee was hired.

B. Contractor shall be responsible to the Town for the acts, negligence and omissions of
all direct and indirect employees and subcontractors. The Contract Documents shall not be
construed as creating any contractual relation between any subcontractor and the Town.

C. Contractor shall provide for and oversee all safety orders and precautions necessary
for the safe performance of the Work. Contractor shall take reasonable precautions for the
safety of all employees and others whom the Work might affect, all work and materials
incorporated into the Work, and all property and improvements on the work site and
adjacent property.

CLEANUP:

A. Contractor shall keep the work site and adjoining ways free of waste material and
rubbish caused by its employees or subcontractors. Contractor shall remove all such waste
material and rubbish daily during construction, together with all tools, equipment,
machinery and surplus materials. Contractor shall, upon termination of its Work, conduct
general cleanup operations on the work site, including the cleaning of all surfaces, paved
streets and walks, and steps. Contractor shall also conduct such general cleanup operations
on adjacent properties which were disturbed by the Work.

B. If Contractor fails to perform the cleanup required by this Section, after written
notice, the Town may cause the cleanup to be performed at Contractor's expense. Upon
receipt of a statement for such cleanup, Contractor shall pay to the Town the costs incurred
by the Town for such cleanup, or the Town shall have the right to withhold said amount
from any final payment due to Contractor.

18
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



3.06 PAYMENT OF ROYALTIES AND LICENSE FEES:

Contractor agrees to pay all royalties and license fees necessary for the Work, and to defend against
all actions for infringement of copyright or patent rights, and to save and hold the Town harmless
from such actions.

3.07 TAXES, LICENSES AND PERMITS:

Contractor shall pay all taxes imposed by law in connection with the Work, except the Town of
Superior Sales Tax, for purchases within the Town, and shall procure all permits and licenses
necessary for the prosecution of the Work. Contractor shall obtain a Town tax-exempt number for
the sales tax exemption.

3.08 SAMPLES AND SHOP DRAWINGS:

Contractor shall furnish, upon the request of the Project Manager, samples and shop drawings to the
Project Manager, who shall review them for conformance with the Contract Documents. All Work
shall comply with approved samples and drawings.

3.09 COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS AND REGULATIONS:

Contractor shall comply with all federal, state and local laws, ordinances, rules, regulations and
orders in any manner relating to the Work. If any provision of the Contract Documents is at
variance therewith, Contractor shall notify the Project Manager promptly.

3.10 SUBCONTRACTORS:

A. Contractor shall furnish to the Project Manager at the time the Construction Contract
is executed, a list of names of subcontractors to whom Contractor proposes to award the
portions of the Work to be subcontracted by Contractor.

B. Contractor shall not employ a subcontractor to whose employment the Town
reasonably objects, nor shall Contractor be required to hire a subcontractor to whose
employment Contractor reasonably objects.

€. All contracts between Contractor and subcontractor shall conform to the provisions
of the Contract Documents, and shall incorporate the relevant provisions of the Contract
Documents.

3.11 CORRECTIVE WORK:

When any Work does not conform to the Contract Documents, Contractor shall make the necessary
corrections so that the Work will so conform. Such corrections shall be accomplished within the
time period approved by the Project Manager. Failure to complete such required corrections within
the time period required shall constitute a breach of the Contract. The Town's review, approval or
acceptance of, or payment for any work shall not be construed as a waiver of any rights under this
Contract or any cause of action arising out of the performance of this Contract.

3.12 OTHER CONTRACTS:

The Town reserves the right to let other contracts in connection with the Work. Contractor shall
cooperate with all other contractors so that their work is not impeded by the Work, and Contractor
shall give other contractors access to the work site necessary to perform their contracts.

19
3:16:2017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



3.13 COMMUNICATION:

Contractor shall direct all communications to the Town regarding the Work to the attention of the
Project Manager.

PART 4. TERMINATION
401 LABOR DISPUTES:

Notwithstanding any other provision contained in this Contract, in the event of any picket or other
form of labor dispute at the construction site, Contractor shall continue to perform the Work without
interruption or delay. If Contractor ceases performance of the Work because of such picket or other
form of labor dispute, the Town may terminate the services of Contractor after giving 48 hours'
written notice of its intent to do so.

402 DEFAULT:

The Town may terminate this Contract upon thirty days' written notice to Contractor if Contractor
defaults in the timely performance of any provision of the Contract Documents, or otherwise fails to
perform the Work, or any part thereof, in accordance with the Contract Documents. Termination of
the Contract by the Town shall not be the Town's exclusive remedy, and the Town may pursue such
other remedies and actions lawfully available to the Town including, but not limited to, an action at
law for damages against Contractor or any bonding agency issuing a bond hereunder, or an action in
equity for injunctive relief.

PARTS. WARRANTIES:
5.01 WARRANTY OF FITNESS OF EQUIPMENT AND MATERIALS:

Contractor represents and warrants to the Town that all equipment and materials used in the Work,
and made a part of the Work, or placed permanently in the Work, shall be new unless otherwise
specified in the Contract Documents. All equipment and materials used shall be of good quality,
free of defects and in conformity with the Contract Documents. All equipment and materials not in
conformity with the Contract Documents shall be considered defective.

5.02 GENERAL WARRANTY:

Contractor shall warrant and guarantee all material furnished and work performed by Contractor for
a period of two years from the date of final acceptance of the Work by the Project Manager. Under
this warranty, Contractor agrees to repair or replace, at its own expense and under the direction of
the Project Manager, any portion of the Work which fails or is defective, unsound, unsatisfactory
because of materials or workmanship, or which is not in conformity with the provisions of the
Contract. Should Contractor fail to perform any such work within the warranty period after a
request by the Town, the Town may withdraw from the Payment and Performance Bond any and all
amounts necessary to complete the required work. The expiration of the warranty period shall in no
way limit the Town's legal or equitable remedies, or the period in which such remedies may be
asserted, for work negligently or defectively performed.

PART 6. BONDS, INSURANCE AND INDEMNIFICATION
6.01 INDEMNIFICATION:

A. Contractor agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the Town and its officers,
insurers, volunteers, representatives, agents, employees, heirs and assigns from and against

20
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



6.02

all claims, liability, damages, losses, expenses and demands, including attorney fees, on
account of injury, loss, or damage, including, without limitation, claims arising from bodily
injury, personal injury, sickness, disease, death, property loss or damage, or any other loss of
any kind whatsoever, which arise out of or are in any manner connected with this Contract
or the Contract Documents, to the extent that such injury, loss or damage is attributable to
the act, omission, error, professional error, mistake, negligence or other fault of Contractor,
any subcontractor of Contractor, or any officer, employee, representative, or agent of
Contractor or of any subcontractor of Contractor, or which arise out of any worker's
compensation claim of any employee of Contractor or of any employee of any subcontractor
of Contractor.

B.  Contractor, to the fullest extent permitted by law, shall defend, investigate, handle,
respond and provide defense for and defend against any such liability, claims, damages,
losses, expenses or demands at the sole expense of Contractor, or at the option of the Town,
Contractor agrees to pay the Town or reimburse the Town for defense costs incurred by the
Town in connection with any such liability, claims, damages, losses, expenses or demands.
Contractor, to the fullest extent permitted by law, shall defend and bear all other costs and
expenses related thereto, including court costs and attorney fees, whether or not such
liability, claims or demands alleged are groundless, false or fraudulent.

C. This indemnification provision is intended to comply with C.R.S. § 13-21-111.5(6)
and shall be read as broadly as permitted to satisfy that intent. Contractor's liability under
this provision shall be to the fullest extent of, but shall not exceed, that amount represented
by the degree or percentage of negligence or fault attributable to Contractor, any
subcontractor of Contractor, or any officer, employee, representative, or agent of Contractor
or of any subcontractor of Contractor. If Contractor is providing architectural, engineering,
surveying or other design services under this Agreement, the extent of Contractor's
obligation to defend, indemnify and hold harmless the Town may be determined only after
Contractor's liability or fault has been determined by adjudication, alternative dispute
resolution or otherwise resolved by mutual agreement of the Parties, as provided by C.R.S. §
13-50.5-102(8)(c).

NOTICE OF CLAIM:

If Contractor receives any claim arising from the performance of the Work, Contractor shall notify
the Town in writing of the nature of the claim within 24 hours of receipt of the claim by Contractor.
In this notice, Contractor shall provide evidence that Contractor has notified Contractor's insurer of
the claim. Contractor shall keep the Town apprised of the disposition of the claim, and Contractor
shall take all necessary action to resolve the claim and make restitution, if required, as quickly as

possible.
6.03 INSURANCE:
A. Contractor agrees to procure and maintain, at its own cost, a policy or policies of

insurance sufficient to insure against all liability, claims, demands, and other obligations
assumed by Contractor pursuant to this Contract. At a minimum, Contractor shall procure
and maintain, and shall cause any subcontractor to procure and maintain, the insurance
coverages listed below, with forms and insurers acceptable to the Town.

1. Worker's Compensation insurance as required by law.

21
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



6.04

2. Commercial General Liability insurance with minimum combined single
limits of $1,000,000 each occurrence and $1,000,000 general aggregate. The policy
shall be applicable to all premises and operations, and shall include coverage for
bodily injury, broad form property damage, personal injury (including coverage for
contractual and employee acts), blanket contractual, products, and completed
operations. The policy shall contain a severability of interests provision, and shall
include the Town and the Town's officers, employees, and contractors as additional
insureds. No additional insured endorsement shall contain any exclusion for bodily
injury or property damage arising from completed operations.

B. Such insurance shall be in addition to any other insurance requirements imposed by
law. The coverages afforded under the policies shall not be canceled, terminated or
materially changed without at least 30 days prior written notice to the Town. In the case of
any claims-made policy, the necessary retroactive dates and extended reporting periods shall
be procured to maintain such continuous coverage. Any insurance carried by the Town, its
officers, its employees, or its contractors shall be excess and not contributory insurance to
that provided by Contractor. Contractor shall be solely responsible for any deductible losses
under any policy.

C. Contractor shall provide to the Town a certificate of insurance as evidence that the
required policies are in full force and effect. The certificate shall identify this Contract.

PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BOND:

Contractor shall furnish a Payment and Performance Bond in the full amount of the Contract Price,
as security for the faithful performance and payment of all Contractor's obligations under the
Contract Documents, including the warranty. This bond shall remain in effect at least until two
years after the date of Final Completion.

PART 7. PAYMENT

7.01

PROGRESS PAYMENTS:

A. The Town shall make periodic progress payments to Contractor within 30 days
following the Project Manager's approval of the Work completed. A progress payment shall
be made only after Contractor has submitted an application for a progress payment on a
form approved by the Project Manager, and if requested by the Project Manager, Contractor
shall submit copies of invoices from subcontractors or supplies and partial waivers executed
by each.

B. Progress payments shall be in an amount equal to 95% of the Work actually
completed. Completed Work shall include materials and equipment not incorporated in the
Work but delivered to the work site and suitably stored.

C. If Contractor fails to complete any required Work within the time period agreed
between Contractor and the Project Manager, or within any time period set forth in the
Contract Documents, as modified or extended, the Town is expressly authorized to withhold
any progress payment for such Work until such Work is completed.

7.02 FINAL PAYMENT:

Upon final acceptance of the Work, the Town shall make final payment to Contractor pursuant to
C.R.S. § 38-26-107.

22
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017 MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



7.03 LIQUIDATED DAMAGES:

A. Because time is of the essence and delayed performance constitutes a compensable
inconvenience to the Town and its residents, the liquidated damages established in this
Section shall be enforced. Such damages are not a penalty. For each day Final Completion
is delayed after the Final Completion date stated in the Construction Contract, as modified
through approved change orders, Contractor shall be assessed the following amounts:

Contract Price Amount per day
$0-$50,000 $350
$50,000-$100,000 $380
$100,000-$250,000 : $440
$250,000-$500,000 $520
$500,000-$1,000,000 $640
$1,000,000-$2,000,000 $820
$2,000,000-$4,000,000 $1,080
$4,000,000-$8,000,000 $1,450
$8,000,000-$12,000,000 $1,820
$12,000,000 or greater $2,250

B. Allowing Contractor to continue and finish the Work or any part thereof after the

Final Completion date shall not operate as a waiver on the part of the Town of any of its
rights under the Contract Documents. Any liquidated damages assessed shall not relieve
Contractor from liability for any damages or costs of other contractors caused by a failure of
Contractor to complete the Work in the Contract Time. Liquidated damages may be
deducted from any payment due Contractor or the retainage. If the liquidated damages
exceed the amount owed to Contractor, Contractor shall reimburse the Town.

7.04 ORAL AGREEMENTS PROHIBITED:

This Contract is expressly subject to the provisions of C.R.S. § 29-1-110(1), and Contractor
acknowledges that neither the Town nor any employee or agent thereof is authorized to expend or
contract for the expenditure of any monies in excess of those appropriated by the Superior Board of
Trustees. The Town acknowledges that sufficient funds have been appropriated to pay the Contract
Price, but Contractor shall not rely upon the appropriation of any funds in addition to those already
appropriated unless and until the same are lawfully appropriated by the Superior Board of Trustees.

7.05 ITEMS NOT INCLUDED IN BID:

No additional compensation shall be paid for any costs or services listed in the Contract Documents
but not specifically listed in the Bid as a Bid item.

7.06 CHANGES IN QUANTITY:

A. Except as provided in Section 7.07, the unit Bid price shown in the Bid Schedule
shall be used to determine the payment owed Contractor for any changes in quantity.

B. The actual quantity placed, as determined by the Project Manager, shall be used to
calculate the payment due to Contractor.

23
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 2017\UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



C. Prior to any Work being performed in excess of any of the Bid Schedule quantities,
Contractor shall notify the Town, in writing, of every quantity that will exceed 105% of the
quantity listed on the Bid Schedule.

D. Except as provided in Section 7.08, Contractor shall not be entitled to compensation
for any increased expense, loss of expected reimbursement or loss of anticipated profits,
directly or indirectly caused by any changes in quantity.

7.07 BID PRICE ADJUSTMENTS:

A. When a major item is increased to more than 125% or decreased below 75% of the
original quantity stated on the Bid Schedule, the unit Bid price shall be modified by written
change order. Payment for major items shall be calculated by multiplying the actual
quantity placed by the modified Bid price.

B. For purposes of this Section, a major item is any item having a Bid value,
determined by multiplying the Bid quantity by the unit Bid price, that exceeds 10% of the
original Contract Price.

7.08 ELIMINATED ITEMS:

Should any items contained in the Bid Schedule be found unnecessary for completion of the Work,
the items shall be eliminated. The Contract Price shall be modified through written change order,
and the amount of the change order shall be the eliminated quantity multiplied by the unit Bid price
stated in the Bid Schedule, minus any reasonable costs incurred by Contractor for the eliminated
items. Reasonable costs shall be determined by the Project Manager based on information provided
by Contractor, and may include mobilization of eliminated materials and equipment mobilization
costs, if the sole purpose of the equipment was to place the eliminated material. In no case shall the
costs exceed the amount of the eliminated items.

7.09 MATERIALS STORED BUT NOT INCORPORATED:

Payments may be made to Contractor for materials stored on the work site but not incorporated into
the Work as evidenced by invoices or cost analyses of material produced, if the material has been
fabricated or processed and is ready for installation into the Work and conforms with the Contract
Documents. Payments shall not exceed 85% of the price shown in the Bid Schedule or 100% of the
certified invoice cost of the stockpiled material, whichever is less. Payment for stockpiled materials
shall not relieve Contractor of responsibility for loss or damage to the material. Payment for living
plant materials or perishable materials shall not be made until the living or perishable material is
made an integral part of the finished Work.

7.10 COST RECORDS:

Contractor shall make cost records available to the Town if the Town deems it necessary to
determine the validity and amount of any item claimed.

PART 8. MISCELLANEOUS
8.01 PUBLICATIONS:

Any and all publications relating to the Work and authored by Contractor or any of its
subcontractors shall be submitted to the Town for its prior written approval of the content of the
publication. If the Town disapproves of the content of the publication, the author shall withdraw it

24
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017 MAY 22, 2017\TEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



from publication. The term "publication" as used herein shall include articles or letters to be
published in any newspaper, magazine, trade journal or other periodical.

8.02 CONFIDENTIALITY:

Any and all reports, information, date, statistics, forms, designs, plans, procedures, systems, studies
and any other communication form of knowledge given to or prepared or assembled by Contractor
under this Contract shall, to the extent authorized and permitted by law, be kept as confidential and
not be made available by Contractor to any individual, company or organization without the prior
written consent of the Town. Notwithstanding the foregoing, Contractor shall not be restricted from
releasing information in response to a subpoena, court order, or legal process, but Contractor shall
notify the Town in writing before responding.

8.03 INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR:

Contractor, for all purposes arising out of this Contract, is an independent contractor and not an
employee of the Town. It is expressly understood and agreed that Contractor shall not be entitled to
any benefits to which the Town's employees are entitled, such as overtime, retirement benefits,
worker's compensation, injury leave or other leave benefits.

8.04 CONFLICTS:
Should any conflict arise in the Contract Documents, the order of precedence is as follows:

Construction Contract.

Special Provisions.

General Provisions.

Supplemental Specifications.

Detailed Plans (Calculated dimensions will govern over scaled dimensions).

SRR

25
3162017
P:ASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



(g ]

SPECIAL PROVISIONS

General.

A. All labor, services, material, and other work necessary for the construction of Tract
H Open Space Landscape shall be provided by Contractor. Contractor's responsibilities
shall include, but not be limited to: managing the budget; scheduling and coordinating work
meetings; conducting field tests and geotechnical studies; preparing exhibits and
participating in formal and informal public meetings at locations provided by the Town; and
timely processing field orders, change orders and notices of substantial completion.

B. Contractor shall carefully examine all Work, and shall be solely responsible for the
character, quality, and quantities of Work, materials, and compliance with the Contract
Documents.

C. Contractor shall identify any and all necessary easements for construction and
maintenance of the Work.

Other Regulations.

A. Contractor shall ensure that the Work is in compliance with the Urban Drainage and
Flood Control District Urban Storm Drainage Criteria Manual, CDOT Specifications,
AASHTO Specifications, International Building Code, Uniform Plumbing Code, Uniform
Mechanical Code, National Electrical Code, Americans with Disabilities Act, and other
applicable codes and specifications.

B. In case of any discrepancy between any of the requirements set forth in the Urban
Drainage and Flood Control District Urban Storm Drainage Criteria Manual, CDOT
Specifications, AASHTO Specifications, International Building Code, Uniform Plumbing
Code, Uniform Mechanical Code, National Electrical Code, Americans with Disabilities
Act, and these Contract Documents, the more stringent requirement shall apply. If any
questions arise as to which requirement is more stringent than another, the Project Manager
shall be authorized to determine which is more stringent, and the Project Manager's decision
shall be final.

Representatives. Contractor shall have at the work site at all times as its agent, a competent
superintendent capable of reading and thoroughly understanding the Contract Documents
and being thoroughly experienced in the type of work being performed. The Town shall
have a representative on the job site to observe work for conformance with the Contract
Documents.

Work Administration. The Town shall administer the Work, including the finalization of
any change orders, pay estimates and payments of such, acceptance of work, and other
matters as stipulated in the Contract Documents.

Engineer. The Engineer for this Work shall be the Town Engineer.

Inspections and Testing.

A. Contractor shall be responsible for performing materials testing. In addition to the
materials testing performed by Contractor, the Town may conduct Quality Assurance
testing at its own discretion.

26
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 2017\UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



B Contractor shall coordinate its construction schedule with the testing agency and
Town so that key inspection points may be observed. If Contractor fails to provide
reasonably adequate notice or proceeds without the required inspection, the subject work
shall be re-exposed or redone in its entirety, while the inspector is present. No extra
compensation shall be awarded to Contractor for extra work due to Contractor's failure to
coordinate inspections with the testing agency or the Town. All costs associated with
Contractor's failure to coordinate inspections shall be borne by Contractor.

C. Contractor shall perform construction inspections. Contractor shall attend any pre-
construction meeting(s) and be available to provide technical assistance during the course of
construction as necessary. Contractor shall provide site visits and reviews upon request
from the Town during the construction phase to ensure compliance with the intent of the
plans and to resolve any potential conflicts. Contractor shall provide a written summary
after each site visit.

D. Contractor shall be responsible for scheduling the final inspection with the Town.

Construction Schedule.

A. At the time of the Pre-construction Conference, Contractor shall prepare and submit
to the Town for review a construction schedule including: proposed daily construction
hours; details of all construction items; start and finish dates; confirmation and dates for
coordinating all utility relocation and/or interruptions; and the same information for all
subcontractor(s). The schedule shall not be changed without prior notification and review
by the Town. The schedule shall be in the form of a chart of suitable scale to indicate
approximately the percentage of Work scheduled for completion at any time. Contractor
shall enter on the chart the actual progress at the end of each 2-week interval as directed by
the Town and shall deliver to the Town 3 copies thereof on a biweekly basis.

B. Contractor shall also prepare and submit a schedule of the anticipated manpower by
title and duty. The manpower proposed shall be adequate for orderly flow of work and
completion within the time specified in the Contract Documents.

C All construction activities shall be coordinated with the Project Manager.
Saturday, Sunday, Holiday and Night Work.

A. Work shall normally not be performed on Saturdays, Sundays, observed holidays, or
outside of the daytime working hours of 7:00 am. to 7:00 p.m., or as indicated on the
construction schedule. Lane closures are restricted to 8:30 a.m. to 3:30 p.m. on arterial and
collector streets, except for such work as may be necessary for proper care, maintenance,
and protection of Work already completed, or in cases where the Work would be
endangered or if hazards to life or property would result.

B. If Contractor believes it necessary to work on Saturdays, Sundays, holidays, or at
night, Contractor shall make prior arrangements with the Town and receive written approval
at least 48 hours before such time so that inspection and engineering services can be
provided. Such approval may be revoked by the Town if Contractor fails to maintain
adequate equipment and lighting at night for the proper prosecution, control, and inspection
of the work. If Work is performed without the Town's prior approval, and as a result the
Town had not assigned inspectors to the work, the Town may declare Work performed
during this period of time defective, solely on the grounds that it was not properly inspected.

27
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617.DOCX



10.

11.

12.

C. Any Work performed on a Saturday, Sunday, holiday, or night shall be at
Contractor's risk in terms of extra costs, extra work, or unforeseen conditions.

Progress Reports.

A. Progress reports and progress/manpower schedules shall be updated and submitted
to the Project Manager at the end of each 2-week period, or at such other times as the
Project Manager may request. Contractor shall also forward to the Project Manager, at the
end of each month, an itemized report of the delivery status of major and critical items of
purchased equipment and material, including shop drawings and the status of shop and field
fabricated work.

B. If the completion of any part of the Work or the delivery of materials is behind the
approved schedule, Contractor shall submit a plan acceptable to the Project Manager for
bringing the Work up to schedule. The Town shall have the right to withhold progress
payments for the work if Contractor fails to update and submit the progress/manpower
schedule and reports as specified.

Pre-construction Conference.

A. Contractor shall coordinate the Pre-construction Conference. Contractor's
designated supervisor(s) assigned to the Work shall attend this meeting.

B. Prior to mobilizing construction equipment, a Pre-construction Conference will be
held. Contractor's designated superintendent(s) or supervisor(s) assigned to the Work shall
attend this meeting. Contractor shall, at a minimum, provide the following to the Town at
the Pre-construction Conference:

(D The construction schedules;

(2) A detailed estimate of partial payments for the Work;

3) The traffic control plan;

4 A detailed plan showing site access and staging areas; and

5 A subcontractor submittal, including names and contact phone numbers.

Fees and Permits.

A. Prior to commencing any Work, Contractor shall secure, at its own expense, all
necessary fees and permits required for the performance of the Work, including an Army
Corps of Engineers 404 permit, if necessary. The cost of compliance with this Section
(including fees) is included in the Contract Price, and no additional compensation shall be
provided.

B. All fees for permits issued by the Town shall be waived.
Existing Utilities.

A. The Work shall be coordinated with all impacted utility companies, districts,
associations, agencies, and residents located in the work site. Contractor shall conduct the
meeting and provide summary minutes.

B. Contractor shall determine the actual location of all existing utilities prior to starting
any Work. Contractor shall contact utility companies for field locations prior to the start of

28
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCSWMEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



13:

14.

15.

16.

17:

Construction Work, and shall contact all utilities at least 48 hours prior to beginning
excavation and/or grading. If the exact location and depth of existing underground utilities
are unknown, Contractor shall perform all necessary exploratory excavation to locate these
facilities which may affect the Work prior to beginning construction. Contractor shall
obtain required locates and Contractor shall include the information on the plans.
Contractor shall resolve any utility discrepancies. Contractor shall be liable for all damage
done to existing utilities in the performance of the Work.

C. If Contractor requests that utility companies relocate utilities for Contractor's
convenience, such relocation shall be at Contractor's expense.

D. The time of performance under the Contract shall not be extended to account for
repair of utilities which are damaged by Contractor.

Water and Electricity. Contractor shall provide and maintain, at its own expense, an

adequate supply of water and electricity required for the Work. Contractor shall install and
maintain supply connections and lines satisfactory to the Project Manager, and prior to Final
Completion, Contractor shall remove the supply lines at its expense.

Dust Control. Contractor shall use measures to prevent and control dust within the area

affected by the Work. No additional compensation shall be paid to Contractor for dust
control. Contractor shall clean any soil, dirt, or debris tracked onto any adjacent streets.
Within 24 hours of notification by the Town that any adjacent streets require cleaning,
Contractor shall clean such streets or the Town may have the streets cleaned and deduct the
cost of such cleaning from the Contract Price.

Construction Staging Areas. All construction staging areas shall be located within the work
site. The boundaries of construction staging areas shall be approved by the Town.
Construction staging areas shall be used for material storage, parking for equipment, and
employees' vehicles. A construction trailer shall not be required, but may be used if the
location of the trailer is approved by the Town. Upon Final Completion, all staging areas
shall be clean and restored to their original condition. No additional compensation shall be
provided to Contractor for cleaning of construction staging areas.

Sanitary Facilities.

A. Sanitary convenience for the use of all persons employed on the work, properly
screened from public observation, shall be provided in sufficient numbers and in such a
manner and at such points as approved by the Town. The contents shall be removed and
disposed of in a satisfactory manner.

B. The sanitary conveniences specified above shall be the obligation and responsibility
of Contractor. The facilities shall be made available to all other contractors, subcontractors,
and inspection personnel in the work site.

€. Contractor shall supply sufficient drinking water from approved sources to all of its
employees.

D. Full compensation for compliance with this Section is included in the Contract Price,
and no additional compensation shall be provided.

Soils Investigations and Foundation Engineering. Contractor shall be responsible for all
geotechnical investigations necessary to design and perform the Work.

29
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017 MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



18.

19

20.

Lines and Grades. Contractor shall lay out the Work and shall be responsible for all
measurements in connection therewith. Contractor shall, at its own expense, furnish all
stakes, templates, platforms, equipment, and labor, including surveyors, that may be
required in setting and cutting or laying out any part of the Work. Contractor shall be
responsible for the proper execution of the Work to such lines and grades.

Traffic Control.

A. Contractor shall furnish all necessary flagpersons; erect and maintain warning lights,
advance warning signs, detour signs, barricades, temporary fence, and sufficient safeguards
around all excavations, embankments, obstructions; and perform any other work necessary
for the protection of all work being performed, and for the safety of the public and
pedestrian traffic, as well as motor vehicles. All signs and barricades shall conform to the
current Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices.

B. At the Pre-construction Conference, Contractor shall submit 5 copies of a traffic
control plan for review by the Town. The plan shall discuss the traffic control measures
proposed for the safety of vehicular and pedestrian traffic through the work site.

. Contractor shall at all times take proper precautions for the protection of and
replacement or restoration of landscaping, driveway culverts, street intersection culverts or
aprons, irrigation crossings and systems, mailboxes, driveway approaches, signs, existing
utilities, and all other public and private installations that may be encountered during the
Work.

1D No driveway or private alley shall be blocked without prior written permission from
the resident who would be affected by such blocking, with a copy to the Town.

E. No road shall be closed at any time.

F. Contractor shall advise the Police Department, school districts, trash services, and
homeowners of any lane closures, including dates and times.

G. It is anticipated that a large number of employees will use automobiles for
transportation to and from the work site. It shall be Contractor's responsibility to: maintain,
protect, and control traffic in the vicinity of and in the work site; restrict parking on streets
near the work site; and provide necessary parking areas for all employees in suitable
locations as approved by the Town.

Archaeological and Historical Discoveries.

A. Contractor shall inform the Town of any evidence which might suggest to a
layperson that archaeological or historical materials may be present in the work site. Upon
making such a discovery, Contractor shall do whatever is necessary to avoid disturbing the
work site. This may require that Contractor's activities be redirected or stopped until the
Town determines how to proceed.

B. As a result of Contractor's efforts to preserve the potential discovery at the work site,
if Contractor's activities are delayed for longer than 8 normal work hours, Contractor shall
prepare accounting information to support an adjustment to the Contract Price.

30
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



21.

22,

23.

24.

25

Water Control.

A. Contractor shall take such precautions as necessary to construct the Work in a dry
condition, and Contractor shall provide for drainage, dewatering, and control of all surface
and subsurface water and shall erect any necessary temporary structures or other facilities at
its own expense.

B. Contractor, at its own expense, shall furnish all necessary equipment and materials
required to control the surface and subsurface water in all the areas from the commencement
of Work through Final Completion.

C. Contractor shall be responsible for furnishing, transporting, and installing all
materials and equipment, well points, pumping, channelization, diversion, damming, or
other means of controlling surface water and ground waters.

Disposal Site

A. Contractor shall be responsible for the removal of all excess excavation, debris,
deleterious material, muck, asphalt, concrete, trees, stumps, remains from clearing and
grubbing, and all other materials not used for the construction of the improvements. Costs
of disposal are included in the Contract Price and shall not entitle Contractor to additional
compensation. Contractor shall designate in writing a disposal site located outside the Town
limits and acceptable to the Town.

B. Contractor's cost for loading, hauling, daily cleaning of streets, disposal of the
earthwork (excavation) materials, together with the construction, maintaining and watering
of haul roads, and dump fees and permits are included in the Contract Price and shall not
entitle Contractor to additional compensation.

Video Prior to Construction. Contractor shall provide the Town with a video of the entire
work site prior to beginning construction, including all adjacent areas, at Contractor's own
expense. One copy of the video shall be provided to the Town and become the property of
the Town prior to the commencement of any Work.

Existing Improvements and Restoration.

A. Contractor has field inspected the work site and fully understands that existing
landscaping and improvements are present within the work site. Such existing
improvements shall be protected. Any damage or disruption in the public right-of-way,
drainage easements, Town property, or private property related to the Work shall be
restored to pre-existing or better condition.

B: Contractor shall be responsible for replacing all existing improvements, including
irrigation systems and landscaping, damaged during Contractor's activities, except as
otherwise provided in the Contract Documents.

Erosion Control. Contractor shall provide an erosion/sediment control plan for use during
construction. The plan shall include site specific details showing the type, location, and
quantity of BMP's to be used. The erosion/sediment control plan shall be designed to
prevent sediment from leaving the construction area. Special attention shall be given to
prevent sediment from entering into any wetland area. .

31
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



26.

Vandalism. Contractor shall take all necessary steps to protect the work site from vandalism.
Contractor shall be solely responsible to repair any damage caused by vandalism, including
the removal of graffiti, at Contractor's own cost. The Contract Price shall not be increased to
reimburse Contractor for such costs.

32
5162017
PASHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

The 2011 Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction shall constitute the Technical
Specifications for the Project, as modified herein.

REVISION OF SECTION 101, DEFINITION AND TERMS
Section 101.27 shall be revised as follows: Department shall be defined as the Town.

Section 101.28 shall be revised as follows: Engineer shall be defined as the Town's authorized
representative who is responsible for engineering supervision of the project. The terms Project
Engineer and Project Manager shall be interchangeable in this Contract.

Section 101.36 shall be revised as follows: Laboratory shall be defined as the testing laboratory of
the Town or other laboratory designated by Town.

Section 101.54 shall be revised as follows: Region Transportation Director shall be defined as the
Town.

Section 101.70 shall be revised as follows: State shall mean the Town.
REVISION OF SECTION 207, TOPSOIL

Section 207.01 shall include the following: All disturbed areas to be landscaped shall be dressed
with 6" of topsoil. All topsoil shall be secured from the site and, if deemed necessary by the Project
Engineer, amended as indicated below in #3 and in Section 212. Contractor shall also place topsoil
upon constructed cut and fill slopes after grading operations are completed and prior to seeding.

Section 207.03 shall include the following:
1. Topsoil Removal

After the construction area and its access have been delineated, the vegetation should be mowed to a
maximum height of 4 inches over the area to be disturbed. If the amount of vegetation exceeds what
can be incorporated into the soil without interfering with establishing a proper seedbed, then excess
vegetation shall be removed. Any subsoil removed shall be placed separate from the topsoil. Under
no circumstances shall subsoil be mixed with topsoil, and subsoil shall not be placed on top of the
topsoil. The topsoil shall be protected from contamination by subsoil material and weeds, and from
compaction by construction equipment and vehicles.

2. Relieving Compaction

Areas that are compacted by heavy equipment shall be ripped or chiseled prior to redistribution of
topsoil. Construction areas and other compacted areas will be chiseled to a minimum depth of 10",
with no more than a 10" interval between chiseled furrows. Two passes with a chiseler may be
necessary, with the second pass chiseling between the first furrows, or perpendicular to original
furrows.

3. Redistribution of Topsoil and Application of Amendments:

The salvaged topsoil should be redistributed uniformly over the disturbed areas, minimizing
compaction by equipment. Topsoil redistribution shall not occur under wet soil conditions. If
topsoil is contaminated, compacted or otherwise improperly handled, topsoil shall be amended with
compost at a rate of 3 cubic yards per 1000 square feet of disturbed area to provide a suitable
seedbed at the contractor’s expense. Compost shall consist of at least 40% organic matter, with a

33
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-4051617.DOCX



pH not to exceed 8.0, and soluble salts not greater than 10 Mmhos/cm. The carbon to nitrogen ratio
of the compost shall be between 10:1 and 20:1. Compost shall be incorporated evenly throughout
topsoil.

Section 207.04 shall be deleted and replaced with the following: Stripping, Stockpiling and
placement of topsoil will not be measured or paid for separately but shall be included in pay item
Landscape Restoration (LS).

Section 207.05 shall be deleted and replaced with the following: Stripping, stockpiling and
placement of topsoil will not be measured or paid for separately but shall be included in pay item
Landscape Restoration (LS).

REVISION OF SECTION 212, SEEDING, FERTILIZER AND SODDING -
Section 212.04 shall be revised to include the following:

1. Soil Preparation

Following redistribution of topsoil, as described in Section 207.03, the disturbed areas shall be
chiseled again to a minimum depth of 10", with no more than a 10" interval between chiseled
furrows. On disturbed areas, further seedbed preparation such as discing, harrowing or firming
operations will be necessary to reduce soil clods that are greater than 4" in diameter, and to provide
a seedbed that is firm and friable.

2. Seeding

The seed mix and planting rate specifications are stated in the Construction Drawings. Seed shall be
drilled with a drill that is capable of placing the specified seed at the specified rate, at a 15" - 3/4"
depth. The drill shall have an 8" or less drill row spacing and be equipped with packer wheels to
firm the soil over the drill row. Dragging chains behind the drill to cover seed is not an acceptable
substitute. Seeding should be completed between October 1 and March 31. Seeding outside this
period must be approved by the Engineer in advance. In between these dates a cover crop may be
used, until the appropriate time to seed with the specified mix.

3. Post-Seeding Weed Control

Reclaimed areas with slopes not exceeding 3:1 will be mowed to prevent flowering and weed seed
development. Hand methods will be implemented on steep slopes. Mowing will be undertaken
twice during the first growing season to prevent desiccation of the grass seedlings with a mowing
height of 6" to 8".

Section 212.08 shall be deleted and replaced with the following: Payment will be made under:

Pay Item Pay Unit
Landscape Restoration Lump Sum

Topsoil, soil preparation, seeding and mulching shall be included in Landscape Restoration (LS).
REVISION OF SECTION 213, MULCHING

Section 213.03 shall be revised to include the following: After seeding has been completed, the
application of mulch is recommended on the seeded areas to protect the seed and conserve soil
moisture which will aid in seedling germination and establishment. The seeded area shall be
mulched within 24 hours after seeding. The following types of mulch are recommended for 3:1
slopes or flatter. Wood fiber hydromulch with guara gum tackifier: A standard rate of 3000 Ibs. per

34
5162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 201 7\MAY 22, 201 7\ITEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617.DOCX



acre of hydromulch and 80 Ibs. per acre of guara gum tackifier will be appropriate for most projects
unless otherwise specified on the project plans. The operator shall spray apply the slurry of wood
fiber mulch according to the manufacture’s specifications in a uniform manner over the designated
seeded areas. Seed shall not be incorporated and applied simultaneously with the hydromulch

slurry.
Section 213.04 shall be deleted and replaced with the following: Mulching will not be measured or
paid for separately but shall be included in pay item Landscape Restoration (LS).

Section 213.05 shall be deleted and replaced with the following: Mulching will not be measured or
paid for separately but shall be included in pay item Landscape Restoration (LS).

REVISION OF SECTION 608, SIDEWALKS AND BIKEWAYS-

Section 608.01 shall be revised to include the following: The Work shall consist of constructing
concrete bikeway in accordance with the lines and grades shown on the plans.

Section 608.02 shall be revised to include the following: Bikeway concrete shall be mixed with
fiber reinforcing strands (or approved equal), at the rate of 1.5 pounds per cubic yard. Mixing,
placing and finishing shall be performed according to manufacturer’s recommendations. Contractor
shall submit a concrete mix design to the Engineer for approval prior to construction.

Section 608.03(c) shall be revised to include the following: Hot weather and cold weather
concreting operations shall be performed in accordance with Section 601.12.

Section 608.03(d) shall be revised to delete the second paragraph.

Section 608.03(e) shall be revised to delete the first paragraph, to be replaced with the following:
Expansion joints should not be used except as noted in this specification. Sawcut the finished
surface of the sidewalk and bikeway with dummy joints on ten foot centers along the sidewalk and
bikeway length. Each sawcut will be one third inch deep for each inch of slab thickness and a
straight line perpendicular to the edges of the sidewalk or bikeway slab. Sawcutting will be
completed before contraction cracks occur. Sawcutting to occur within 24 hours of concrete
placement. Toweled or tooled joints will not be acceptable for the sidewalk or bikeway dummy
joints.

Section 608.03(f) shall be revised to include the following: Concrete shall not be left exposed for
more than 30 minutes between the time finishing is completed and commencement of curing
treatment unless approved by the Town. Impervious white curing compound to be applied
immediately after broom finish. Sections of sidewalk or bikeway which develop random cracking
shall be removed and replaced by Contractor at Contractor's expense.

REVISION OF SECTION 608, SIDEWALKS AND BIKEWAYS

Section 608.06 shall be revised to include the following: Fibrous polypropylene filaments will not
be paid for separately, but shall be included in the work. Proof rolling will not be paid for
separately but shall be included in the Work.

35
3162017
P:\SHARED\PHYLLIS HARDIN\WPDOCS\MEETINGS 2017\MAY 22, 201 7UTEM #12D - 3CONTRACT FOR TRACT H-A051617. DOCX



A ® DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
aAcokRD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 52212017

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER ﬁgﬂ‘g\cv
Olson & Olson Ltd PHONE _ o o oo [FAX" 2 an.
5655 S. Yosemite St. #200 (pC o, ey 303-867-2086 (ke 0ra.
Greenwood Village CO 80111 | ADDRESS:02(@)0ISO . T —
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC# |
. , | INsurer A :Travelers Indemnity Company 5658
INSURED . ARNOL-1 INSURER B e . P5674 |
H-2 Enterprises, LLC iNSurer ¢ :Homeland Ins Co of New York 34452
4626 Weld County Road 65 :Charter Oak Fi
Keenesburg CO 80643 INSORERD: Fire Ins Co — 25615
INSURERE : o e
INSURERF :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 1323661567 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

SR ADDL[SUBR POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
thid TYPE OF INSURANCE INSR | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
A GENERAL LIABILITY VTC2KCO5644B160IND16 10/1/2016 10/1/2017 EACH OCCURRENCE $1,000,000
X | " DAMAGE TO RENTED
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $300,000
l cLams-MaDE | X | occur MED EXP (Any one person) | §5,000
o N PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $1,000,000
’ B GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $2,000,000
pouicy [X | FBS: Loc s
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY VTC2KCAP5644B172IND16 101172016 | 10/1/2017 | GOMEINED SINGLETMIT™T 500 500
X | aNY aUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
ALL OWNED SCHEDULED -
S s S OPERTIAASE
X | HRenautos X | aUTOS (Per acident) $
$
B X | UMBRELLA LIAB X | occur VTSMJCUP5644B196TIL16 10/1/2016 10/1/2017 EACH OCCURRENCE $5,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $5,000,000
DED |X | RETENTION $ 10.000 $
D | WORKERS COMPENSATION VTC20UB5644B20316 10172016 [ 10/1/2017  [x | WCSTATU. S
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E L EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? N/A
{Mandatory In NH) E L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $1,000,000
If yesdescribe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E L DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT I $1,000,000
c Pollution Liability 7930006700005 10/1/2016 10/1/2017 Each Poll Condition 2,000,000
Claims-Made Form Aggregate 2,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, if more space Is required)

Certificate Holder and those listed below (if any) are Additional Insureds as respects General Liability and Umbrella Liability on a Primary and
Non-Contributory basis, and Auto Liability and Pollution Liability only if required by written contract or agreement and coverage applies only as
respects work performed by the Insured for the Additional Insureds. Ali coverage terms, conditions, and exclusions of the policy apply. The
Worker's Compensation, General Liability, Auto Liability, Umbrella Liability and Pollution Liability policies include a Waiver of Subrogation in
favor of the Additional Insureds only if required by written contract or agreement.

Tract H Open Space: Landscaping.

Additional Insured(s): Town of Superior and the the Town's officers, employees, and Contractors.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
) SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
Town of Superior THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
East Coal Creek Drive ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
Superior CO 80027
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Remell R DK

© 1988-2010 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2010/05) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




